Procurement Contracts Officer:
Brenda Sensibaugh

6763 OF
Nebraska Department of Transportation

A B | C | D E | F G | H [ | J K | L M | N 0 | P Q | R S | T
% CATHER AND SONS GRIMES ASPHALTAND | KNIFE RIVER-SOUTH DAKOTA KNIFE RIVER
| ASPHALTIC CONCRETE PLANT PICKUP BARKLEY ASPHALT CONSRUCTION ING. VNG CORPORATION o ION D EaT OMNI ENGINEERING PAVERS INC. SIMON CONTRACTORS
2] Description Qty UOM UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE oM UNIT PRICE UNITPRICE | EXTPRICE | UNITPRICE | EXTPRICE | UNITPRICE | EXTPRICE | UNITPRICE | EXTPRICE | UNITPRICE | EXT PRICE
1 |DIST 1 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE
LINCOLN & SURROUNDING 5000 ™ 6625 $ 331,250.00 No Bid $ 7675 $ 383,750.00
.| |AREA
, 6400 N 70th Street 12303 Hwy 6
4 PLANT ADDRESS & LOCATION: Lincoln, NE Waveryly, NE 68462
51 [MIXNAME: SPR FINE SPR
6| [ASPHALT BINDER: 58v-34 58H-34
.| |DATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE: March 6, 2023 MARGCH 27TH 2023
2 [DIST 1 ALTERNATE MIX #1
LINCOLN & SURROUNDING 200 ™ 5000| $  11,800.00 No Bid $ 7775|'$  15,550.00
8| |AREA
) 6400 N 70th Street 12303 Fwy 6
9 PLANT ADDRESS & LOCATION; Lincoln, NE Waveryly, Ne 68462
0| [MIX NAME: SPR FINE SPR
11| [ASPHALT BINDER: 58-28 58V-34
»| |DATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE: March 6, 2023 APRIL 1st 2023
3 |DIST 1 ALTERNATE MIX #2
LINCOLN & SURROUNDING 50 ™ 5000 $  2,950.00 No Bid No Bid
13| |AREA
PLANT ADDRESS & LOCATION: 6400 N 70th Street
14 Lincoln, NE
15|  [MIX NAME: SPR FINE
6| [ASPHALT BINDER: 58-28
7| |PATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE: March 6, 2023
4
DIST 2 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE . .
AL A & SURROUNDING area | 500 ™ 6625 $  33,125.00 No Bid $105TON | $  52,500.00 No Bid
18
) 6400 N 70th Street 2991 G Stor
o] |PLANT ADDRESS & LOCATION: oo NE oy
20|  [MIX NAME: SPR FINE SPR
21| [ASPHALT BINDER: 58v-34 5834
22 | | | |
,5| |[DATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE: March 6, 2023 APRIL 1, 2023
5
DIST 2 ALTERNATE MIX #1 . .
.| [omAHiA 5 SURROUNDING AREA 50 ™ 5000 $  2,950.00 No Bid $95TON | $  4,750.00 No Bid
PLANT ADDRESS & LOCATION: 6400 N 70th Street 6506 Grover St
25 Lincoln, NE
26 MIX NAME: SPR FINE Commercial
27| [ASPHALT BINDER: 58-28 5828
,s| |[DATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE: March 6, 2023 APRIL 1, 2023
6
DIST 2 ALTERNATE MIX #2 . .
| [omAHA 5 SURROUNDING AREA 50 ™ $ 5900 §  2,950.00 No Bid No Bid
PLANT ADDRESS & LOCATION: 6400 N 70th Street
30 Lincoln, NE
31| [MIXNAME: SPR Fine
32| [ASPHALT BINDER: 58-28
45| |DATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE: March 6, 2023
7 |DIST 3 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE
NORFOLK & SURROUNDING 4000 ™ $ 86.00| $  344,000.00 No Bid $ 120.00| $ 480,000.00| $ 86.00| $ 344.000.00| $ 87.00| $ 348,000.00 No Bid
34| |AREA
. 2210 Alumax RD 2220 Hawkeye Drive
45|  |[PLANT ADDRESS & LOCATION: SIOUX CITY, IA 1100 E. Monroe Ave - Norfolk e Siou Oty 1A 51106
36|  [MIXNAME: 172" SURFACE SPR D2 W/RAP SPR
37| [ASPHALT BINDER: 58-28 PG 58H-34 PG 5828 PF 58H-34
DATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE MAY 1, 2023 April 15, 2023 APRIL 15, 2023 APRIL 15, 2023
38
8 |DIST 3 ALTERNATE MIX #1
NORFOLK & SURROUNDING 50 ™ $ 96.00| $ 4.800.00 No Bid $ 11000 $  5500.00| $ 86.00| $  4,300.00| $ 7300 $  3.650.00 No Bid
39| |AREA
. 2210 Alumax RD 2200 Hawkeye Drive
40| [PLANT ADDRESS & LOCATION: SIOUX CITY, IA 1100 E. Monroe Ave - Norfolk e Sioox Oty A 57106
21|  [MIX NAME. 3/8" SURFACE SPR D2 W/RAP IDOT MIX
42| [ASPHALT BINDER: 58-28 PG645-22 PG 58-28 PG 58-28
45| |DATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE: MAY 1, 2023 April 15, 2023 APRIL 15, 2023 APRIL 15, 2023
9 [DIST 3 ALTERNATE MIX #2
NORFOLK & SURROUNDING 50 ™ $ 102.00| $ 5.100.00 $ 9500| $  4,750.00| $ 86.00| $  4,300.00 No Bid
44| |AREA
45| |PLANT ADDRESS & LOCATION: SIOUX CITY, IA 1100 E. Monroe Ave - Norfolk 221%’;}“&‘;" RD
26| [MIX NAME. SPR 7C D2 W/RAP

Page 1 of 3

Opening Date: February 28, 2023
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A B | C | D E | F G | H | | J K | L M | N o) | P Q | R S | T
1+ CATHER AND SONS GRIMES ASPHALT AND KNIFE RIVER-SOUTH DAKOTA KNIFE RIVER
e ASPHALTIC CONCRETE PLANT PICKUP BARKLEY ASPHALT CONSRUGTION, ING. BPAVING CORPORATION VANKTON MIDWEST OMNI ENGINEERING PAVERS INC. SIMON CONTRACTORS
2|~ Description [Qty | UOM UNIT PRICE | EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE | oM UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | EXT PRICE | UNITPRICE | EXTPRICE | UNITPRICE | EXTPRICE | UNITPRICE | EXTPRICE | UNITPRICE | EXT PRICE
47| |ASPHALT BINDER: 64-34 PG645-22 PG 58-28
4| |DATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE: MAY 1, 2023 APRIL 15, 2023
10 [DIST 4 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE
GRAND ISLAND & 5000 ™ No Bid No Bid
49| |SURROUNDING AREA
50| [PLANT ADDRESS & LOCATION:
51 MIX NAME:
52| [ASPHALT BINDER:
53| |DATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE:
11|DIST 4 ALTERNATE MIX #1
GRAND ISLAND & 5000 ™ No Bid No Bid
54| |SURROUNDING AREA
55| [PLANT ADDRESS & LOCATION:
56| [MIX NAME:
57| [ASPHALT BINDER:
55| |PATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE:
12 |DIST 4 ALTERNATE MIX #2
GRAND ISLAND & 5000 ™ No Bid No Bid
59| |SURROUNDING AREA
60| [PLANT ADDRESS & LOCATION:
61 MIX NAME:
62| [ASPHALT BINDER:
53| |PATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE:
13 |DIST 5 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE
SCOTTSBLUFF & 3500 ™ No Bid No Bid $ 9150| $ 320,250.00
64| |SURROUNDING AREA
. 120018 21st Ave
65| |PLANT ADDRESS & LOCATION: Scottabluft
66| [MIXNAME: SPR
67| [ASPHALT BINDER: 580-34
65| |DATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE: 441123
14 |DIST 5 ALTERNATE MIX #1
SCOTTSBLUFF & 50 ™ No Bid No Bid $ 9150 $  4,575.00
69| |SURROUNDING AREA
_ 120018 21st Ave
70|  |PLANT ADDRESS & LOCATION: Scottabluft
71 MIX NAME: SLX
72| [ASPHALT BINDER: 58V-34
14|  |DATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE: 4/1/23
15 |DIST 5 ALTERNATE MIX #2
SCOTTSBLUFF & 50 ™ No Bid No Bid
74| |SURROUNDING AREA
75| [PLANT ADDRESS & LOCATION:
76| [MIXNAME:
77| [ASPHALT BINDER:
Jg| |DATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE:
16 |DIST 6 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE
SPR NORTH PLATTE, . .
LEXINGTON, OGALLALA & 500 ™ No Bid No Bid
79| |SURROUNDING AREA
80| [PLANT ADDRESS & LOCATION:
81 MIX NAME:
82| [ASPHALT BINDER:
g3| |PATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE:
17 [DIST 6 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE
SPS NORTH PLATTE, . .
LEXINGTON, OGALLALA & 600 ™ No Bid No Bid
84| |SURROUNDING AREA
85| [PLANT ADDRESS & LOCATION:
86| [MIX NAME:
87| [ASPHALT BINDER:
gg| |PATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE:
18 [DIST 6 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE
SPH NORTH PLATTE, . .
LEXINGTON, OGALLALA & 600 ™ No Bid No Bid
89| |SURROUNDING AREA
90| [PLANT ADDRESS & LOCATION:
91 MIX NAME:
92| [ASPHALT BINDER:
o3| |PATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE:
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Brenda Sensibaugh Nebraska Department of Transportation
A B | C | D E | F G | H | | J K | L M | N o) | P Q | R S | T
TS CATHER AND SONS GRIMES ASPHALT AND KNIFE RIVER-SOUTH DAKOTA KNIFE RIVER
e ASPHALTIC CONCRETE PLANT PICKUP BARKLEY ASPHALT CONSRUCTION. INC. PAVING CORPORATION YANKTON MIDWEST OMNI ENGINEERING PAVERS INC. SIMON CONTRACTORS
2 |~ Description Qty UOM UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE OM UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT PRICE
19 |DIST 6 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE
SLX, NORTH PLATTE, . .
LEXINGTON, OGALLALA & 600 ™ No Bid No Bid
94 SURROUNDING AREA
95 PLANT ADDRESS & LOCATION:
96 MIX NAME:
97 ASPHALT BINDER:
08 DATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE:
20 [DIST 6 ALTERNATE MIX
NORTH PLATTE, LEXINGTON, . .
OGALLALA & SURROUNDING | 2° ™ No Bid No Bid
99 AREA
100] [PLANT ADDRESS & LOCATION:
101 MIX NAME:
102] [ASPHALT BINDER:
103|  |DATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE:
21|DIST 7 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE
MCCOOK & SURROUNDING 50 N No Bid No Bid
104| |AREA
105 [PLANT ADDRESS & LOCATION:
106]  [MIX NAME:
107] [ASPHALT BINDER:
108|  |PATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE:
22 [DIST 7 ALTERNATE MIX #1
MCCOOK & SURROUNDING 50 N No Bid No Bid
109] |AREA
110] [PLANT ADDRESS & LOCATION:
111 MIX NAME:
112]  [ASPHALT BINDER:
113|  |DATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE:
23 [DIST 7 ALTERNATE MIX #2
MCCOOK & SURROUNDING 50 N No Bid No Bid
114| |AREA
115]  [PLANT ADDRESS & LOCATION:
116]  [MIX NAME:
117]  [ASPHALT BINDER:
15| |PATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE:
24 |DIST 8 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE
AINSWORTH & SURROUNDING | 200 N No Bid No Bid
119] |AREA
120] [PLANT ADDRESS & LOCATION:
121 MIX NAME:
122 [ASPHALT BINDER:
13|  |DATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE:
25 [DIST 8 ALTERNATE MIX #1
AINSWORTH & SURROUNDING | 200 N No Bid No Bid
124| |AREA
125]  [PLANT ADDRESS & LOCATION:
126]  [MIX NAME:
127] [ASPHALT BINDER:
10g| |PATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE:
26 [DIST 8 ALTERNATE MIX #2
AINSWORTH & SURROUNDING | 200 N No Bid No Bid
129| |AREA
130] [PLANT ADDRESS & LOCATION:
131 MIX NAME:
132] |ASPHALT BINDER:
133|  |DATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE:
134|Total [ $ 353,900.00 | $ 385,025.00 [ $ 490,250.00 | $ 352,600.00 [ $ 351,650.00 | $ 57,250.00 | $ 399,300.00 | $§ 324,825.00
135|Payment Terms Net %, 30 DAYS Net %, 30 DAYS None %, NONE DAYS N/A %
136|Delivery Days ARO 10 DAYS 3 DAYS 7 DAYS 30 DAYS Per ITB
137/Comments
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